
 

ANYBILL.COM  |  1801 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW, Suite 700

Anybill Financial Services, Inc. 
1801 Pennsylvania Ave NW  
Suite 700    
Washington, DC 20006  
 
 
April 1, 2013 
 
 
Dear Sir or Madam, 

 
Anybill Financial Services, Inc. is a third party tax payment service provider who remits payments and tax returns for 
corporations doing business within your jurisdiction.  This letter is 
system error occurred resulting in a batch of tax payments and returns 
jurisdiction by February 20, 2013. 
 
This internal malfunction was caused by a recent check printing enhancement and no system notification was made to 
alert Anybill of the unprinted tax payments and returns.  
Commission that corresponds with the late return and payment
January due February 2013 filing period
 
Anybill Financial Services asks that any late penalty be waived due to this account’s previous paym
penalty cannot be waived, please send the invoice which contains the total amount due to the address below.
 
Thank you for your time, 
 
ATTN: Logan Livingstain 
Anybill Financial Services, Inc. 
1801 Pennsylvania Ave NW 
Suite 700 
Washington, DC 20006 
 
If you have any questions, please do not 
assistance with this matter. 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 
Logan Livingstain 
 

Phone: (202) 499-7872 

Alternate Phone: (866) 957-2455 (Opt 1)

Email: tax@anybill.com 

Avenue, NW, Suite 700  |  Washington, DC 20006  |  W 202-682-6300  |  F 

 

    Check Number: 4060385
    Tax Id: 7894 
    Tax Period: January 2013
    Entity: Comcast Phone of Oregon LLC

is a third party tax payment service provider who remits payments and tax returns for 
corporations doing business within your jurisdiction.  This letter is to inform you that on February 19, 2013, an internal 

in a batch of tax payments and returns that did not print and were due to your 

This internal malfunction was caused by a recent check printing enhancement and no system notification was made to 
Anybill of the unprinted tax payments and returns.  Enclosed, you will find the notice issued by the 

orresponds with the late return and payment by Comcast Phone of Oregon LLC, 7894
January due February 2013 filing period attached to check 4060385 

Anybill Financial Services asks that any late penalty be waived due to this account’s previous payment history.  If the 
penalty cannot be waived, please send the invoice which contains the total amount due to the address below.

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to reach out to me using the information below.  I appreciate your 

(Opt 1) 

|  F 202-833-2141 

 
4060385 

January 2013 
Comcast Phone of Oregon LLC 

is a third party tax payment service provider who remits payments and tax returns for 
, 2013, an internal 

were due to your 

This internal malfunction was caused by a recent check printing enhancement and no system notification was made to 
Enclosed, you will find the notice issued by the Public Utilities 

, 7894, for the 

ent history.  If the 
penalty cannot be waived, please send the invoice which contains the total amount due to the address below. 

I appreciate your 

mailto:tax@anybill.com






DAVIS Diane 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 

Karpf, Rashi [Rashi_Karpf@comcast.com] 
Monday, April 08, 2013 2:05 PM 
SHEPHERD Kathy 

Cc: 
Subject: 

DAVIS Diane; Zambrano, Dominic; Piperata, Brian; llivingstain@anybill.com 
FW: Comcast Phone of Oregon -Account ID: 7894- Penalty Waiver Request 

Hello Kathy, 

Please accept this email correspondence as an official authorization to allow Anybill to proceed with the waiver 

request on behalf of Com cast Phone of Oregon. If you need any more information regarding this authorization please 

feel free to contact me. 

Thank you 

Rashi 

From: SHEPHERD Kathy [mailto:kathy.shepherd@state.or.usl 
Sent: Tuesday, April 02, 2013 12:44 PM 
To: Logan Livingstain 
Subject: RE: Comcast Phone of Oregon -Account ID: 7894 -Penalty Waiver Request 

Logan, 

In order to process your waiver request, we need an email (addressed to me, with a cc to Diane Davis 

[diane.davis@state.or.us]) that clearly states that Com cast Phone authorizes Anybill to pursue the waiver on its behalf. 

Thank you. 

Kathy Shepherd, RSPF Compliance Specialist 

Residential Service Protection Fund, www.rspf.org 

Oregon Public Utility Commission 

kathy.shepherd@state.or.us, (503) 378-4927 

From: Logan Livingstain [mailto:Llivingstain@anybill.com] 
Sent: Monday, April 01, 2013 7:21 AM 
To: PUC.FilingCenter 
Cc: SHEPHERD Kathy; Anne Pomeroy; Aksana Aleksiaichuk; Jan Rosen 
Subject: Comcast Phone of Oregon -Account ID: 7894-Penalty Waiver Request 

Dear Sir or Madam, 

Please find attached a formal penalty waiver request in response to the assessment that is attached here as well. I ask 

that all future correspondence with regards to the penalty waiver be directed through me. 

Please advise as to the time line when a resolution will be reached. 

Thanks! 

Logan 
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