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 BEFORE THE PUBLIC UTILITY COMMISSION 

OF OREGON   

UW 120 
 

In the Matter of  
 
CROOKED RIVER RANCH WATER 
COMPANY  
 
Request for Rate increase resulting in total 
annual revenues of $868,453.  
 

  
 
STAFF MOTION TO STRIKE 

INTRODUCTION 

On October 5, 2007 the Administrative Law Judge (ALJ) issued a memorandum in this 

proceeding establishing October 19, 2007, as the date for filing cross-examination estimates and 

motions to strike.  On August 21, 2007, the ALJ stated that:  “The Company’s rebuttal case will 

be limited to information that has been provided to parties through discovery.”  The ruling 

further states that:  “The schedule allows for discovery on the Company’s rebuttal testimony.  In 

the event the Company does not respond fully to discovery by staff and intervenors, the 

Company’s rebuttal testimony will be stricken.” 

As a result of the above ruling, Staff respectfully requests that the following testimony 

and statements be stricken from the record.  Copies of CRRWC’s proffered statements and 

testimony, with Staff’s proposed strikethroughs, have been provided as Attachment A.   

I.  Statement of James Rooks 

 In addition to its rebuttal testimony, CRRWC filed a document entitled “Statement of 

James Rooks.”  This Statement of James Rooks does not purport to be rebuttal testimony.  In 

fact, James Rooks did file a separate document entitled “Rebuttal To PUC Testimony.” 

 Because September 21, 2007, was the filing deadline for rebuttal testimony, the 

Statement of James Rooks should be stricken in its entirety.  If the Public Utility Commission of 

Oregon (Commission) is inclined to consider the Statement of James Rooks as rebuttal 
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testimony, Commission Staff moves that the following portions of the statement be stricken 

because they refer to issues not included in CRRWC’s testimony or properly responded to in 

Staff’s data requests.1 
 

• Throughout this entire process, Michael Dougherty has totally ignored one big aspect 
of this company’s operation, and that is to provide fire protection to the entire 
community of Crooked River Ranch.  This water company owns the water rights, the 
piping, and all the fire hydrants.  The Fire Department owns no water or hydrants.  I 
have tried to work hand in hand with the Fire Board of Directors and the Fire Chief 
over the years to get adequate water to high risk areas.  I have installed numerous 
hydrants and fire stand pipes over the years, and extended the water lines in high risk 
areas.  I’ve been trying to close loops in areas identified in our 20-year plan, and 
others that I have identified.  If this company cannot continue with its plan to drill a 
new well and the associated piping, this whole ranch will be at risk.  See Statement of 
James Rooks at 3; Data request nos. 94(a), 129(i), 130(a), 130(b), 130(c), 130(e), 
138(b), 139(a), 139(b), 139(c), 139(d), and 139(e)).2 

 
• The CRRWC Board of Directors adopted a resolution in 2004 to assess each member 

$8 per month for 15 years in order to cover the costs of a new well, piping, cistern 
replacement, etc.  The intent was to pay as we go - not cause debt for the members to 
repay.  Michael Dougherty has totally removed our assessment, telling us to go 
borrow $1 million plus, pay back interest, and let the customers pay it back.  That is 
totally outside our way of thinking, and we believe, not good business practices.  See 
Statement of James Rooks at 3; Data requests nos. 3, 110, 121, 122, 124(b), 126, 127, 
and 139(f); see also data request no. 140, which is not due until October 23, 2007.3 

 
• Michael Dougherty has not allowed for unpaid accounts in any manner.  We track 

these accounts monthly, and we have a large number of people that do not pay timely.  
Since this company runs off the customer payments, not having $10,000 paid each 
month can cause some problems for the company. See Statement of James Rooks at 
4; (No amount was included in the Company’s application (page 13 of 30)); Data 
request no. 137. 

 
• In addition, he made no allowance for the cross connection program.  This company 

has been actively enforcing the cross connection policies set out by the Board of 
Directors over the years.  This is a state and federal requirement, that has not been 
strongly enforced in the past, but is becoming more prevalent today.  The backflow 
installation and testing is paid for by the customer, but it still involves many hours of 
staff time to monitor and record the results.  See Statement of James Rooks at 4; (No 

                                                 
1 In this motion, Staff moves that certain statements and rebuttal testimony be stricken from the record based upon 
CRRWC’s testimony and failure to provide answers to data requests.  Staff explicitly reserves the right to object to 
the admission of evidence at the evidentiary hearing. 
2 In this motion, Staff has not provided a copy of each data request sent nor the insufficient data response in the 
circumstances where a data response was provided. Staff will be prepared and intends to offer the data requests and 
responses, where any, at the evidentiary hearing.  Staff, however, will provide copies of these documents earlier at 
the request of the ALJ.   
3 Because the motions to strike are due before a few recent data requests are due, Staff has noted the data request and 
due date herein. 
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amount was included in the Company’s application (page 13 of 30)); see also Data 
request, no. 141(a), which is not due until October 23, 2007.) 

 
• An example of how this effects us is in his comments about the radio read meters that 

the company added to the tariffs.  His comment was since the company didn’t show 
any reduction in personnel, it didn’t warrant the cost.  This company has 5 full time 
employees.  Currently, it takes 2 of them a minimum of 3 days each to physically read 
each meter each month.  Our roads have no shoulders, curbs or sidewalks, and often 
the meter-reader has to go over embankments to the meter.  In winter months, snow 
and ice turn many of our roads into basically one lane.  It causes a true safety hazard 
for the employee.  Radio read meters would allow one person to drive by, 
electronically gather the information, and complete the reading in probably 1 day or 
less.  We wouldn’t be laying off any employees as they have other duties.  But it 
would make the whole process 100% safer for staff, and would eliminate constant 
complaints by the Watch Dog group of misread readings.  But, Mr. Dougherty 
refused to add this to the rate case.  See Statement of James Rooks at 4; Data request 
no. 134(a) and 134(c); see also Data request, no. 141(b) is not due until October 23, 
2007. 

 
• As it stands now, Mr. Dougherty has allowed no money for repairs, which means this 

system will not operate very long.  We are dealing with 30 year old pipes with 
millions of juniper tree roots invading them.  When they leak and break, they have to 
be replaced in order to continue providing potable water to our customers, and to 
proved fire protection to our community.  This isn’t going to happen on this budget.  
See Statement of James Rooks at 5;  (Did not provide 2005 and 2006 invoices as 
requested in data requests nos. 26, 27, and 131(b); Data request 131(b) also requests 
invoices for 2003 through 2005;  Motions to Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 
27, 2007, and October 3, 2007.  

 
II.  Rebuttal to PUC Testimony 
 

Staff moves that the following rebuttal testimony be stricken from the record as they refer 
to issues not properly responded to in Staff’s data requests. 
 

• Michael Dougherty has never asked what the company does with the money brought 
into the company.  …..  Since he doesn’t know how the company operates, it is not 
credible for him to determine what the company needs to continue to exist or the 
needs of providing fire protection to this community. See Rebuttal to PUC Testimony 
(Rebuttal) at 5-6; Data requests nos. 3, 110, 121, 122, 124(b), 126, 127, and 128. 

 
• Michael Dougherty has asked for incredible amounts of information, most of which 

was provided by the company.  However, the company has refused to provide 
information that has nothing to do with the 2007 rate case.  See Rebuttal at 6; Motions 
to Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 27, 2007, and October 3, 2007. 

 
• Michael Dougherty has failed to make any allowance for unpaid accounts.  Since this 

company has no income other than customer accounts, it is vital that an allowance be 
made for unpaid accounts and the cost of staff time to attempt collection.  See 
Rebuttal at 6; (No amount was included in the Company’s application (page 13 of 
30)); see also Data request no. 137.  
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• #6: Special Contracts = Assessment.  This is being removed by the PUC for various 

reasons, however, the company believes it should continue to be included.  This 
company doesn’t stand still, it has continued to repair and upgrade in its planning for 
the future.  This company has stayed debt free, and has shown a proven method of 
operating for the past 9 years.  The PUC wants the company to borrow money and 
repay millions of dollars of interest.  How is this benefitting the members of this 
company?  See Rebuttal Pages 7 and 8; Data requests nos. 3, 110, 121, 122, 124(b), 
126, 127; see also Data request No. 140, which is not due until October 23, 2007. 

 
• #14: Copies of all phone bills were submitted to PUC for 2004 - 2007.  All lines are 

accounted for.  PUC has reduced the budget from $16,000 to $9,078 with basically no 
explanation other than removing Webformix.  The company has 4 main office lines 
that are used daily, including long distance calls, and one fax line.  In addition, there 
are 4 lines dedicated to SCADA.  The office and fax lines would show long distance 
use, however, the SCADA lines are local.  One line also is connected to the managers 
home for SCADA, but is used once in a while when a call is being returned due to 
pager activity.  The pager is through Clackamas Cellular and Paging, and is paid 
every 3 months.  The PUC requires an emergency number for nights, weekends and 
holidays, and this is our number.  In addition, the manager has a satellite phone 
service in his work vehicle.  Due to his hearing disability, and the fact that cell service 
is lacking in many parts of the ranch and general tri-county area, this service is 
absolutely necessary in order for the manager to maintain contact with the office and 
the water system.  Failure of the PUC to provide adequate funding to maintain this 
vital service is negligent on their part.  See Rebuttal at 8; Data requests nos. 50 and 
138(a). 

 
• #19:  The reduction from $34,000 to $3,666 is complete irresponsibility.  Mr. 

Dougherty notes that he moved some costs to plant (Staff/102, Dougherty/2), and 
claims to have not received sufficient information.  He was provided a year end 
financial statement for 2006, however, he chose to not use that report, and preferred 
to cut the company budget, making it impossible to cover even one repair to the 
system.  See Rebuttal at 8;  2006 invoices not submitted per data request 26; see also 
Data request 131(b) that also requests invoices for 2003 through 2005. 

 
• #20:  CRRWC is over 30 years old.  In 2006, $82,000 was spent on repairs to the 

system.  The PUC has reduced this to $30,633.  Again, Mr. Dougherty moved costs to 
plant, which he decreased, and “unilaterally removed repair costs to fix vehicles from 
transportation costs”.  As covered in #19, the 2006 year end statement was provided 
to Mr. Dougherty, he chose not to use it, and therefore, cut the funding for “repairs to 
water plant” by 38%.  With a system as old as this one, with PVC pipe and thousands 
of juniper tree roots invading the pipe, there is no way that the company can do all the 
repairs, emergency and preventative, on $30,633.  Again, this is pure negligence on 
the part of the PUC.  The primary function of the water company is not domestic 
water.  It is and always has been fire protection, which was not addressed in Mr. 
Dougherty’s rates.  See Rebuttal at 8-9; 2006 invoices not submitted per data requests 
nos. 27, 131(b), and 138(b); 131(b) also requests invoices for 2003 through 2005.) 

 
• #29:  Contract Services - Other: The SCADA Maintenance agreement was mistakenly 

overlooked at the time of the original tariff filing.  Comm-link Communications 
provides the repair and servicing of the SCADA system for the CRRWC.  There is a 
monthly charge of $360 for servicing the 6 sites in which SCADA is active.  This 
would total $4,320 per year for monthly maintenance.  In addition, the company 
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spends approximately $2400 per year in repair costs when the computer system 
scrambles in lightening storms, repairing damage from vandalism at the SCADA 
sites, etc.  This would be a total expense of $6,720.  Michael Dougherty had a copy of 
the contract in his possession, but never made any data requests for further 
information.  A further example of his selective ways to conduct this process.  See 
Rebuttal at 9-10; Data request No. 50. 

 
• #32:  Small tools was reduced from $5,000 to $175.  This is ridiculous for a company 

that does most repairs in house - one set of good wrenches costs more than $175.  See 
Rebuttal at 10; 2006 invoices not submitted with data request no. 33. 

 
• This recommended budget will not only destroy the company’s efforts, it will also 

place 5000 peoples lives and homes in extreme danger for lack of adequate fire 
protection.  CRR RFD does not own one drop of water and doesn’t own or maintain 
any fire hydrants.  The Crooked River Ranch Rural Fire Protection District is 
dependent on CRRWC for fire protection resources.  CRRWC Exhibit #1.  This 
budget is completely unreasonable.  In fact, CRR is listed in the Federal Register 
dated 8/17/01, of the Department of Agriculture, Department of Interior, as a 
community at risk from wildfire.  CRRWC Exhibit #2.  This year alone, there have 
been 3 fires at the Ranch ranging in size from a couple of acres to over 300.  A net 
income of $25,000 will not sustain fire protection in our area.  See Rebuttal at11; 
Data requests nos. 94(a), 129(i), 130(a)(b)(c)(e); see also Data requests nos. 140(a) 
and 143, which are not due until October 23, 2007. 

 
• Without adequate fire protection persons and property on CRR are at risk.  Michael 

Dougherty’s proposed budget does not allow CRRWC to provide adequate fire 
protection.  Counsel for the Water Co. has advised us that awareness of a risk to 
either persons an property and a conscious disregard for that risk opens us up to both 
civil and criminal liability.  CRRWC has an obligation to it’s customers and the 
persons who live on CRR.  See Rebuttal at 11-12;  Data requests nos. 94(a), 129(i), 
130(a)(b)(c)(e); see also Data requests nos. 140(a) and 143, which are not due until 
October 23, 2007. 

 
• 6/15-16: The permit that the CRRWC has from WRD for 5.0 cfs is adequate for our 

needs.  However, the company cannot prove up on this permit without the new well.  
If Mr. Dougherty had taken the time to come to the office this would have been 
explained in detail.  The transfer of water rights from the Association Well #3 to the 
new well that the CRRWC intends to drill, has nothing to do with the fact that the 
company has until 10/08 to prove up.  Again, Mr. Dougherty has misinterpreted what 
the Company is doing, and has used inaccurate information from intervenor’s.  See 
Rebuttal at 12-13; Data request no. 94(a), 130(b)) 

 
• 7/12: The company has not declared that the 5.0 cfs in water rights is not enough.  

What we have said, is that due to the way this system is configured, we cannot prove 
up on our 5.0 cfs without the new well.  Mr. Dougherty is spouting a lot of numbers 
without knowing what any of it means.  The primary fire protection for any 
community is provided through one of 2 resources: 1) adequate storage facilities, and 
2) adequate source (i.e. number of wells).  As it stands today, this water co-op has 
neither.  This is yet another subject not broached in this rate case.  See  Rebuttal at 13; 
Data request no. 130(b). 
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• Water storage (i.e. 1.5 million gallon standpipe) is completely out of the question 

financially for this small community.  Our $8 assessment was levied by the Board of 
Directors primarily to address source water for fire protection, and that is the 
proposed Well #3, and secondly, to prove up on our water rights.  Both issues were 
purposely undermined by Michael Dougherty’s irresponsible proposal in this rate 
case.  See Rebuttal at 13; Data requests nos. 94(a), 130(b) and 139(b). 

 
• 9/12: CRRWC refused to answer DR questions that were outside the realm of this 

budget process.  PUC asked for a test year - CRRWC clearly stated 2007 as the test 
year.  The application makes no mention of previous years or insistence of receipts 
like Michael Dougherty has requested.  Mr. Dougherty states in his testimony that he 
was provided copies of the Company’s financial reports, but “...was not inclined to 
use unaudited financial reports as a basis for costs.” (Staff/100, Dougherty/12, line 4).  
Instead, he used “guess work and assumption” (stated in a settlement conference) to 
complete his budget.  That’s a good basis to use that effects the lives of 5000 
people!  Not to mention an insult to the professional services rendered by company 
accountants. 
CRRWC made a deliberate invitation to Michael Dougherty to  
come to the company office and discuss this revenue case, which was flatly refused.  
As far as intervenors are concerned, water company policy is that we will answer 
policy questions from non-biased intervenors.  Soule and Nichols do not fall into this 
category.  The manager of CRRWC extended a full invitation to intervenor Cook to 
come in and we would show him everything.  He’s never come in.  This company 
has, nor never will, use guesses and assumptions that co-op members will have to 
support.  And we have no intention of using Michael Dougherty’s budget in this 
co-op!  See Rebuttal at 14; Motions to Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 27, 
2007, and October 10, 2007. 
 

• 12/7: Mr. Dougherty specifically refers to a “macro” review.   What better evidence 
than a year end financial statement which he refused to use?  He also refers to a 
“micro” review in the same line, but absolutely refused repeated invitations to 
examine the system and on-site records.  A review of a utility cannot be done strictly 
by numbers as there are too many variances and factors that come into play.  Another 
vivid account of Michael Dougherty’s inability to do his job properly. See Rebuttal at 
14;  Motions to Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 27, 2007, and October 10, 
2007; Data requests 131(b). 

 
• 14/2: The recommended rate base of $517,194, allows for almost no repairs to the 

system or infrastructure upgrades, radio read meters, etc.  How is this good for the 
community or company?  How does this budget allow the company to earn an 
adequate return on its investment?  See Rebuttal at 14; Data request no. 129(a)(b). 

 
• 15/17: The PUC has continued to challenge our status as a co-op (5/12), referring to 

the CRRWC as a homeowners association.  In his testimony, Mr. Dougherty states in 
17/11 that “the Company can not make a special assessment for future costs that may 
or may not come to fruition”.  ORS 94.595 “Reserve Account for replacing common 
property: reserve study: 30-year maintenance plan” states, in part, “(1) The declarant 
shall: (a) Conduct a reserve study...and (b) establish a reserve account for 
replacement of all items of common property which will normally require 
replacement....” #(2) (a) A reserve account established under this section must be 
funded by assessments against the individual lots for which the reserves are 
established.”  The Company has met the requirements as outlined in this rule.  
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Therefore, Mr. Dougherty, by not allowing the company to continue the assessment 
and establish the reserve fund, is violating a state law which mandates that the reserve 
accounts be maintained.  CRRWC Exhibit #3.  See Rebuttal at 15; Data request no. 
129(c)(d)(e)(f)(g)(h). 

 
• Michael Dougherty cannot disregard the provisions of ORS 94.595.  ORS 94.595 is a 

mandatory requirement for all “association” as that term is defined under Chapter 94 
of the Oregon Revised Statutes.  It is well established that any OAR promulgated by 
the PUC regarding rate setting does not trump a provision of the ORS that speaks to 
the financial planning for a recognized association.  Regardless of established legal 
principles we are compelled to point out that the PUC has already conceded to our 
argument.  See Rebuttal at 15; Data request no. 129(c)(d)(e)(f)(g)(h). 

 
• 17/13: Mr. Dougherty has completely overlooked the fact that a balloon payment is 

due on the building in 2008, or we have to refinance again.  This company has 
worked hard to reduce the debt so that it can be paid in full on time.  This may not be 
the best way according to PUC, but unlike PUC, this company prefers to operate on a 
cash basis and avoid finance charges that have to be passed on to the customers.  See 
Rebuttal at15; Data request 139(f). 

 
• 24/8: Copies of all phone bills were submitted to PUC for 2004 - 2007.  All lines are 

accounted for.  PUC has reduced the budget from $16,000 to $9,078 with basically no 
explanation other than removing Webformix.  The company has 4 main office lines 
that are used daily, including long distance calls, and one fax line.  In addition, there 
are 4 lines dedicated to SCADA.  The office and fax lines would show long distance 
use, however, the SCADA lines are local.  One line also is connected to the managers 
home for SCADA, but is used once in a while when a call is being returned due to 
pager activity.  The pager is through Clackamas Cellular and Paging, and is paid 
every 3 months.  The PUC requires an emergency number for nights, weekends and 
holidays, and this is our number.  In addition, the manager has a satellite phone 
service in his work vehicle.  Due to his hearing disability, and the fact that cell service 
is lacking in many parts of the ranch and general tri-county area, this service is 
absolutely necessary in order for the manager to maintain contact with the office and 
the water system.  Failure of the PUC to provide adequate funding to maintain this 
vital service is negligent on their part.  See Rebuttal at 18; Data requests nos. 50 and 
138(a). 

 
• 25/19: Mr. Dougherty reduced O & M Materials & Supplies by $30,334, claiming 

that the CRRWC did not provide proof of expenses.  The Company gave Mr. 
Dougherty the year end financial statements showing all expenses for 2006, Mr. 
Dougherty chose to not use it, and therefore, disallowed the costs.  Where in the 
OAR’s or ORS’s does it state that receipts need to be provided for every item, or at 
those requested at the whim of the PUC? 
Mr. Dougherty took the first 3 months of 2007 to use as an average.  The winter is a 
time when little work is done.  Mr. Dougherty did not ask for further information.  
The company provided the year end financial statement to show the amount spent in 
2006.  Mr. Dougherty’s use of the first quarter of 2007 is a deliberate attempt to cut 
finances for this company.  See Rebuttal at 18); 2006 invoices not submitted per data 
requests nos. 26, , 27, and 131(b);  131(b) also requests invoices for 2003 through 
2005;  Motions to Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 27, 2007, and October 10, 
2007. 
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• 27/6: Again, CRRWC provided the year end financial statement to Mr. Dougherty 

which he chose not to use in his calculations.  This more than meets “the burden of 
showing that the rate or schedule of rates proposed to be established or increased or 
changed is just and reasonable.”  Look at what was spent, and how much money the 
company had left at the end of the year.  I think that more than covers it.  See Rebuttal 
at 18-19; 2006 invoices not submitted per data requests nos. 26, 27, and 131(b); 
131(b) also requests invoices for 2003 through 2006; Motions to Compel issued on 
June 26, 2007, August 27, 2007, and October 10, 2007. 

 
• 30/7: In Staff 100, Dougherty/30 line 4, the $13,266 in repair costs that Michael 

Dougherty removed, were for parts that were above and beyond Mr. Rooks agreement 
for repairs.  Prime example for Michael Dougherty’s shell game with numbers.  No 
where in his budget does he allow for parts on equipment.  Thus, another erroneous 
attempt to cut our budget and his inability to properly design a budget for this 
company.  Look at the numbers in this paragraph.  He increases fuel cost by a very 
low percentage and reduces repair cost completely.  Where does Mr. Dougherty 
obtain his authority to completely eliminate repair parts on our equipment?  Mr. 
Dougherty completely ignored the crane, except to continue to allege that the 
company paid for it twice.  The crane is an important asset to the company as it is 
needed for maintenance due to the 1000' foot depth of the wells.  See  Rebuttal at 19-
20; Data request nos. 49 and 122. 

 
• 35/6: The crane was not paid for twice as Mr. Dougherty has continued to claim.  As 

we have stated repeatedly, the original purchase dollars came out of the general 
account.  When the assessment was instituted, the cost was deducted from the 
assessment fund and reimbursed to the general fund.  Mr. Dougherty’s continued 
insinuation and statements that this piece of equipment was paid for twice only goes 
to show his involvement with the Water Watch Dogs and his absolute attempt to 
assist the Dogs.  See Rebuttal at 20; Data request No. 122. 

 
• 36/1: Moved operating expenses to plant.  Then decreased the value of plant.  Shell 

game.  See Rebuttal at 21; Data request no. 137(b). 
 

• 36/3: Wes Price, Company Accountant says the depreciation on the building is 35 
years, Mr. Dougherty decides 25.  We believe Wes is more aptly qualified to make 
this determination.  See Rebuttal at 21; Data request no. 139(g). 

 
• One subject that has been ignored by Mr. Dougherty is fire protection.  He tried to 

charge the fire department for water they use when fighting fires, but ignores the need 
for fire protection.  During a recent wildland fire at the ranch, Mr. Rooks had all 
pumps running.  At one point, the 700,000 gallon tower was down to 1' of water.  Not 
only would the firefighters have been without water, so would the customers of the 
company.  Well #4 is our primary well.  If it should go down for any reason, Well #2 
could not provide adequate water for members, and certainly not for firefighting.  Our 
new well location is at adequate height to  be able to pump to the tower and gravity 
feed the system.  The entire system...One of the biggest expenses this company has is 
electricity during the summer.  It takes both wells to supply the members.  Well #2 is 
pumping to the cistern, which then pumps to the system.  This is where out biggest 
electrical charge occurs.  By having another well on top, we can maintain the gravity 
feed which will reduce electrical costs considerably.  See Rebuttal at 22-23;  Data 
requests nos. 94(a), 129(1), 130(b)(e), 138(b), and 139(a)(b)(c)(d)(e). 
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• 48/3: By what authority can Michael Dougherty reprimand the General Manager by 

cutting his wages?  Mr. Rooks has responded to all customer complaints in a very 
timely manner, and it needs to be noted, the company has not been found at fault on 
any of them.  Where does Mr. Dougherty get off establishing a job title and salary for 
Mr. Rooks, based on his “assumption” of his position and scope of duties and 
responsibility?  The Board of Directors of the CRRWC established his duties when 
they developed his employment contract.  They are the only ones to “reprimand” Mr. 
Rooks, and they would only do so after a complete investigation of the situation.  
Investigation is the key word here - one that the PUC and Mr. Dougherty failed to 
include in this proceeding.  The answers to the Data requests have been provided that 
were deemed relevant to the company regarding the rate case.  Those requested by 
Mr. Soule were not, and this has already been explained several times.  This company 
will not assist Mr. Soule in promulgating gossip and innuendo against the CRRWC, 
Employees, or Board of Directors, which is all he is doing on behalf of the Dogs.  See 
Rebuttal at 23; Motions to Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 27, 2007, and 
October 10, 2007. 

III.  Testimony of Wes Price 

The following comments should be stricken from the record as they refer to issues not 

properly responded to in Staff’s data requests. 
 
• If the PUC believes that the members or not owners, then CRRWC must be an 

association.  As such, the company would fall under the provisions of ORS 94.595 
which requires an association with more than 100 members to have in place a reserve 
account for replacing common property and have cash reserves adequate to fund a 30-
year maintenance plan.  Mr. Dougherty’s analysis of and recommendations for 
operating costs do not address the requirements of this law and are therefore not 
adequate to meet the requirements of operating this entity.  ORS 94.595(1)(2)(a) 
states that a reserve account must be funded by assessments against individual lots.  
The rate model does not adequately address this requirement of law.  See Testimony 
of Wes Price at 1; Data request No. 129(c)(d)(e)(f)(g)(h). 

 
• The homeowners/ratepayers would feel a substantial increase in fire insurance rates if 

CRRWC was not able to provide adequate fire flows on demand.  Fire flow 
capabilities are a critical and substantial part of anticipated system improvements and 
enhancements.  Fire flows are also a significant reason for CRRWC attempting to true 
up its water rights at the 5 cfs level rather than settling for the existing level.  The 
staff referenced 20 Year master Plan and Water Management and Conservation Plan 
documents discuss the needed system improvements to accomplish meeting the 
system and customer needs.  Mr. Dougherty ignores these documents when CRRWC 
included in its rate request anticipated capital improvements to accomplish the 
objectives outlined in these plans.  See Testimony of Wes Price at 2; Data request 
nos. 94(a), 130(a)(b)(c)(e), and 139(a)(b)(c)(d)(e). 

 
• Mr. Dougherty also fails to calculate properly the to peak demand for the system at 

full build out.  As he states the total potential lots for the Ranch is 2600.  Current lots 
covered by the water utility stands at 1554.  Using existing customers August, 2006 
peak demand at 927,182 gallons, the total peak demand assuming the same usage for 
2600 customers would be 1,551,270 gallons per day.  Add one wildfire and the total 
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potential peak demand rises to 2,551,270 gallons per day, much closer to the 
3,230,000 gallons per day that the water right permit application requests.  It would 
appear that the requested permit is in line with the 20 year plan and fire flow needs of 
the Ranch owners.  See Testimony of Wes Price at 2; Data request 130(b). 

 
• Rebuttal to Staff 100/12 – Mr. Dougherty states that he normally uses a macro and 

micro review of utility operations to determine if operating expenses serve the 
“usefulness in utility operations” criteria.  Mr. Dougherty was provided with 
compiled financial statements for the preceding four years of CRRWC operations.  
These financials included a GAAP basis balance sheet and statement of operations 
and were prepared on an accounting basis that was consistent for all years. These 
financial statements provide a very reasonable basis for the “macro” view of CRRWC 
operations.  Excluding depreciation expense, cash paid operating expenses for each 
year are as follows: 2003 - $596,131, 2004 - $456,046, 2005 - $583,963, 2006 - 
$597,441.  The average of these four years is $558,395 cash paid operating expenses.  
Using a “macro” view to analyze costs of operations a prudent analysis would say 
that the average operations cost, plus depreciation and an appropriate rate of return, 
should be covered in rates.  Mr. Dougherty ignores the “macro” and apparently 
focuses on the “micro” analysis.  He proposes total rate revenues of $525,295 (less 
than average costs), and expects that the utility operate with an anticipated cash paid 
operating cost level of $457,408 ($499,901 minus $42,463 in depreciation). Any 
prudent analysis at the “macro” level clearly shows that CRRWC will expend any 
cash reserves on operations and all future system improvements would be required to 
be funded with outside debt borrowings. See Staff 100/44.  This is not the intended 
result contemplated in normal application of owner-operated rate calculations.  Mr. 
Dougherty has changed the application of the model in this circumstance.  See 
Testimony of Wes Price at 2-3; 2006 invoices not submitted per data requests nos. 26, 
27, 33, 41, 101(a), and 131(b); 131(b) also requests invoices for 2003 through 2006.  
Motions to Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 27, 2007, and October 10, 2007. 

 
• Rebuttal to Staff 100/34 – Mr. Dougherty states that he does not believe his 

calculations reduce operating expenses to a point where the utility will not be able to 
operate.  His conclusion is based, reluctantly, on comparing operations costs with two 
other Central Oregon utilities (both owner-operated with rates of return).  He states 
that he has recommended $436,153 in cash operating costs, his model actually 
calculates to $457,408, but in either case, the actual prior four year average is 
$558,395.  He gets to his “recommended” level by slashing costs in labor and costs of 
system maintenance.  Both costs are significantly understated in his analysis and can 
be easily averaged over the last four years to obtain a normalization that meets rate 
setting analysis criteria and produces a more realistic costing model.  See Testimony 
of Wes Price at 3; 2006 invoices not submitted per data requests nos. 26, 27, 33, 41, 
101(a), and 131(b); 131(b) also requests invoices for 2003 through 2006;  Motions to 
Compel issued on June 26, 2007, August 27, 2007, and October 10, 2007. 

 
• Rebuttal to Staff 100/34 to 36 – The calculation of utility plant apparently contains 

errors from both CRRWC and PUC staff.  Included with this testimony is a complete 
utility plant listing.  Mr. Dougherty adds and removes assets based on criteria that 
shows he has never seen a depreciation schedule outside the utility rate setting arena.  
As is the case with most small companies, assets that are self-constructed or are 
financed with construction debt often span more than one accounting period.  Costs 
are captured as they are incurred and placed in assets, then when the asset is 
completed all elements are then triggered for depreciation.  Very rarely are the 
components “embedded” into a single asset as there are sometimes reasons to be able 
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to track how costs were accumulated into the completed project.  As a result CRRWC 
has a number of “components” on the depreciation schedule that are still very real 
assets and a part of the utility operations.  I asked for the opportunity to meet with 
Mr. Dougherty one-on-one to sort out the clerical inaccuracies in his schedule and 
was not allowed to do so.  He missed a number of items and I now once again request 
the opportunity to set the proper utility plant schedule for CRRWC.  See Testimony 
of Wes Price at 3;  Data requests nos. 51, 52, 53, 60, 94(a), 133, and 135. 

 
• Rebuttal to Staff 100/37 – Mr. Dougherty’s NPV of the proposed radio read meters 

does not include a number of other factors worth considering.  First is a safety and 
workers compensation insurance issue.  A number of meter sets are in steep and 
difficult to access locations exposing the company to loss of time injuries. Second, a 
number of complaints with the PUC relate to inaccurate meter reads. The Company 
desires to reduce complaints and promote accurate billings to customers.  Third, the 
estimated payroll savings could be substantially higher than the original estimates 
give by Company staff.  The Board of Directors believes that the project has merit 
and will be pursuing additional data for a future rate case to seek approval.  See 
Testimony of Wes Price at 3; Data requests nos. 55, 134(a)(c). 

 
• Rebuttal to Staff 100/38 – CRRWC agrees with the removal of original costs of the 

utility under the CIAC provisions.  However, a number of system line extensions that 
were only partially paid by users were excluded at 100%.  In addition, all meter sets 
were excluded as CIAC assets, this is only partially true.  When CIAC removal from 
rate base was discussed with the constituent water utilities, there was an 
understanding that an appropriate and adequate rate of return on remaining utility 
plant was necessary to sustain healthy utility operations.  I was a party to those 
discussions and agreed with staff conclusions to remove CIAC plant.  I have seen the 
model work when there is an appropriate rate of return.  If staff is unwilling to allow a 
reason rate of return then staff must allow depreciation on the CIAC plant to create 
plant replacement cash flows.  To take both sides of the equation down puts an 
unhealthy squeeze on utility operations.  As requested above, I believe this issue can 
be resolved with a PUC staff meeting on the whole utility plant matter.  See 
Testimony of Wes Price at 3; Data requests nos.  51, 52, 53, 54, 129(a), 129(b), and 
135. 

 
• Rebuttal to Staff 100/39 to 41 – A rate of return at 4.13% is too low.  It does not 

reflect the utility cost of capital.  Mr. Dougherty does not even state the interest rates 
on the two notes.  His model allows for the recovery of payments only and zero return 
on the member capital.  The only cash recovery anticipated is the annual depreciation 
amount.  This is simply not adequate to meet ongoing utility replacement needs nor is 
it in compliance with ORS 94.595 as noted earlier.  Mr. Dougherty’s analysis of cash 
flows for future investments of $69,385 is really $23,301 less due to existing loan 
payments or $46,084, which approximates annual depreciation. See Testimony of 
Wes Price at 3-4; Data requests nos. 129(a), 129(b), and 136. 

CONCLUSION 

 For the foregoing reasons, Staff respectfully requests that the Statement of James Rooks 

be stricken in its entirety or, alternatively, that the portions discussed herein be stricken.  Staff 
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further requests that the portions discussed herein of the Rebuttal and Testimony of Wes Price be 

stricken. 
 

 DATED this 19th  day of October 2007. 

Respectfully submitted, 
 
HARDY MYERS 
Attorney General 
 
 
s/Jason W. Jones_______________ 
Jason W. Jones, #00059 
Assistant Attorney General 
Of Attorneys for Public Utility Commission of 
Oregon Staff 

 
 
 








































































